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Up Coming Events 

COMMUNITY MEDITATION MEETINGS 
 

Three linked Festivals of Spring 
Taurus, Monday, May 16, 2011 @ 7:45 PM 

Gemini, Tuesday, June 14 @ 7:45 PM     
 
In this Issue 
Conscious Reconstruction: Saving The Planet                                                      by Tom Carney 
 
 

 
 

 
Workshops/Classes  (To participate, please call to arrange a meeting) 
Building the Lighted Way - Sundays @ 9:00 AM  
Building the Lighted Way - Tuesday Mornings @ 10:30 AM  
The Nature of the Soul – Tuesday Evenings @ 7:00 PM 
 
 

May 3, 2011 through June1, 2011 
Group Meditation Work 

Of what nature is the future life?  A Treatise On White Magic P. 83 
 

June 2, 2011 through June 30, 2011 
The mind is the instrument which registers the process of "becoming" but it is also—during 
the later stages of human unfoldment—capable of registering the nature or function of 
being. Becoming is revealed through the medium of the intellect; Being, through the medium 
of the intuition. Glamour P. 174 
 
 
 

Arcana Workshops 

Arcana Workshops is a non-profit tax exempt corporation. Donations are greatly appreciated and tax deductible 

Meeting Location: 
3916 Sepulveda Blvd., Suite 107 
Culver City, CA 90230 

Mail Address: 
P.O. Box 506 

Manhattan Beach, CA 90267-0506 
 

www.meditationtraining.org 
webdisciple@meditationtraining.org 
Phone 310-749-3585, 310-545-0910 
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Conscious Reconstruction: 
Saving The Planet 

 
 

here are, as the ancient Wisdom 
tells us, big wheels and little 
wheels. There are big cycles and 

little cycles. There are cycles within 
cycles within cycles. Our present capacity 
to comprehend the magnitude of the 
interlocking harmony and beauty of these 
infinitely nested four dimensional cycles is 
pretty limited. However, we have 
developed the mental capacity to 
understand that we do in fact live within a 
multidimensional, infinitely rational and 
harmonious Cosmos. 

Little Wheels 
We also have long understood the cycles 
of some of the little wheels. We 
understand and harmonize with the cycle 
of day and night. We live in harmony with 
the cycles of the seasons and the motion 
of the Earth around the Sun. 

Those who have been able to free 
themselves from the myopic illusion of 
dense physical, single dimensional reality 
have been able to encompass other more 
subtle dimensional cycles as well. We 
have learned to understand a bit about 
the rhythms of these cyclic patterns and 
how they synchronize with a deeper 
Cosmic rhythm of inbreathing and 
outbreathing. And we have begun to learn 
how to harmonize our livingness with 
these deeper rhythms. 

We have also learned that these cycles 
are transmission systems for energy 
waves, and we have learned that these 

energy waves are not all the same. They 
carry different frequencies and qualities. 
Over the eons, we have been able to 
learn and understand a bit about the 
different qualities of the energy waves 
which impact our planet. We have been 
able to adjust our lives to be more in 
harmony with these rhythmically 
appearing qualities and thereby to be 
more effective in our efforts to serve the 
Plan.  

Big Wheels 
So, we are aware of the Cosmic wave 
cycles that are the Big Wheels. We have 
some understanding of some of the still 
major but lesser wave cycles like the 3, 9, 
and 27 year Earth and Solar cycles, and 
we are working diligently to synchronize 
our creative efforts with those cycles. 

We have more understanding of the little 
wheel cycles and the energies which they 
carry which concern our immediate 
planetary rhythms. The cycle that we are 
focused on right now is the inbreathing 
side of the little wheel cycle in this solar 
year, 2011. We are well into this 
inbreathing cycle and will at the full moon 
of Taurus arrive at its peak. It is 
interesting to note that this peak inbreath 
is held in the silence by the Christ from 
the full moon of Taurus until the full moon 
of Gemini when it is released into world 
service of all kinds.  

We have become aware of the fact that 
the power levels of the incoming energy 

T 
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Riding the ninth wave 

waves have been ramping up for some 
time. This swell in the energy waves has 
more than likely been building long before 
our awareness of it. However, starting in 
1945 we experienced the first direct 
impact of the Shamballa energy wave. 
We know of and have registered two 
additional impacts of that energy wave 
since.  

People who have spent time observing 
the wave action of our oceans say that 
waves usually come in sets of 9 or 10. 
The waves become larger and peak at 
the 9th or 10th

We are currently, as I said, 
well into this yearly inbreathing cycle, and 
we are conscious of the alignments of the 
energy peaks of the Solar wave cycle. 
Underlining our sense of the rapidly 
escalating power levels of the incoming 
waves, events on the dense physical over 
the past 5 or 6 years, in both nature and 
human-generated systems, have been 
extraordinarily colossal in size and effect.   

. From the way things have 
been developing, it feels like we are riding 
the ninth wave, and this would coincide 
with the alignment of the peaks of the 3, 
9, and 27 year cycles of the 
Solar wave cycle in 2012. 

The driving force in these recent cycles 
has been augmented with the energy we 
call Synthesis. Realizing that what we see 
happening on the dense physical is a 
shadow of what has occurred on the 
subtle planes. Images like tsunamis, 
earthquakes, hurricanes, world around 
economic collapse, outbreaks of people 
power demanding and getting freedom, 
even atomic explosions are inadequate to 
indicate the actual magnitude of the 

energy flows that are pouring from the 
subtle planes into our planet. 

The impact at the conjunction of the 
highest and lowest at the Aries full moon 
was profound. What we registered in that 
exact time meditation was so high and so 
pure that it is still unintelligible to us. 
However the unmistakable, the 
unavoidable message was that this was 
the harbinger of what is to come in 
Taurus. 

We have been focusing our attention 
pretty much on the physical plane not 
being aware of the fact that these 
inflowing energies have moved through 
the more subtle planes on their way into 

dimensions that we can 
actually register. Think 
4th

We have all observed the effect of 
throwing a big rock into a pool of water.  
Big Splash! A series of waves that move 
in a circle out from the center of the 
splash. Those waves are energy 
transmission vehicles. They are carrying 
the energy released by the impact of the 
rock on the water. 

 dimensionally for a 
few minutes. Realize that 

the physical plane is a dimension of 
energy that is more dense than any other, 
but is not separated from the other less 
dense dimensions in any way. Think of 
the less dense dimensions as an infinite 
ocean of energy. Waves of energy which 
originate in the depths of that Cosmic 
Ocean are constantly circulating in and 
through these less dense dimensions of 
Cosmos. There is no separation. All is 
energy moving at different frequencies 
and carrying different qualities or Rays as 
we call them. 
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The Intention of Cosmos is 
balance and harmony. 
Reconstruction is unavoidable. 

We think that these transmission waves 
end when they reach the shore of the 
pool. Not so. The energy continues to 
move through the matter of which the 
shore is composed. This is basically the 
dynamic of how energy moves through 
Cosmos. 

In the subtle dimensions, the rocks 
thrown into the pool are the Intentions of 
a Creator. The intensions are powered by 
the Will of the creator. When these waves 
impact the energy fields of various 
dimensions they move through the matter 
of that dimension. Since most energy in 
the less dense dimensions of Cosmos is 
already in some form, essentially, these 
energy waves are waves of Synthesis or 
reconstruction. 

If the forms of the 
matter through 
which the waves 
move are in 
harmony with the 
intention of 
Cosmos the reconstruction will build an 
even more perfect form of that intention. If 
the forms of the matter are not in 
harmony with the Cosmic Intention, but 
discordant and chaotic, the reconstruction 
will be more violent; however, it will go 
forward. 

It is clear that the incoming energy waves 
of reconstruction, which is essentially the 
energy of Synthesis, are impacting the 
planet and having significant effects. The 
Intention of Cosmos is balance and 
harmony. Reconstruction is unavoidable. 

When a wave of synthesis energy 
impacts an area in which people live in 
form situations that are incoherent or out 

of harmony with Cosmic Purpose 
destruction will result. Except to respond 
rapidly, with loving kindness and right 
sharing, to the needs of the people in the 
impacted areas, there is not much we can 
do in a short term proactive way about 
the tsunamis, earthquakes and tornadoes 
which, as unfolding effects of the 
reconstruction, will continue. 

These kinds of so-called natural disasters 
require long range solutions to the 
imbalance and incoherence that has 
generated them. This imbalance and 
incoherence is a direct result of the 
heartless disregard and ignorance of our 
relationship with the ecosystems of the 
Planet. However, we do have an 
immediate and crucial co-creative 

opportunity in the 
reconstruction of 

man-made 
systems of 

government, 
economics, 

education and so forth. If we have the 
love and will, there is much we can do of 
a proactive nature about the chaos 
engendering, huge aberrations and 
imbalances that we have constructed 
within the body of the planetary life.  

The level at which we can implement new 
systems that replace, upgrade, bring 
harmony and balance into those areas 
which are grossly out of harmony—our 
financial system for example which is 
based on the delusional notion that 
“Greed is Good” or our general economy 
which is based on the psychotic vision 
that “Endless War” is natural to the 
human condition—will make the 
reconstruction very much less 
destructive. 
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The primary victims of these grossly 
aberrated, human designed and 
implemented systems based on "Greed 
is Good" and "Endless War" are, you 
guessed it, children. 

If we ignore these conditions, or work half 
heartedly to reconstruct them—which is 
worse than doing nothing because it is a 
lie to cover selfishness—and fail to bring 
balance and harmony into our systems, 
the kinds of destruction that we will see 
will eventually be very much more visible 
and very much more terrible than what an 
earthquake will do. 

These kinds of results are visible now to 
those who are not half buried in the 
cemetery of their personal comfort. These 
kinds of destructions which will proceed 
eventual reconstruction will be more like 
the world around, growing problem of 
shortages or, in some cases, the 
complete absence of basic needs like 
water, food, 
housing, to 
say nothing of 
decent life 
supporting and 
sustaining 
employment 
for millions 
upon millions of people. 

A New York Times front page story 
reports that one in 50 Americans has no 
cash income. “Almost six million 
Americans receiving Food Stamps report 
they have no income. They described 
themselves as unemployed and receiving 
no cash and no welfare, no 
unemployment insurance, and no 
pensions, child support or disability pay. 
About one in 50 Americans now lives in a 
household with a recorded income that 
consists of nothing but a Food Stamp 
card,” the New York Times’ Jason 
DeParle reported. 

The primary victims of these grossly 
aberrated, human designed and 
implemented systems based on Greed is 
Good and Endless War are, you guessed 
it, children. The following link will take you 
to Marion Wright Edelman’s web page for 
the Children’s Defense Fund. I point to 
this site because it contains factual data 
that highlights the depth of the real 
problem we face as humanity. Check it 
out. 

http://www.childrensdefense.org/child-
research-data-publications 

It would be an easy matter to cite data 
that reveals how our Government is 
under constant assault by the lobbyists— 

the present 
name for the 
minions being 
led by the 
cadre of 
Darkness—to 

steer the 
Common 

Wealth into the bank accounts of those 
who fly the banner of Greed Is Good, or 
to cite statics about parents who have to 
watch their children sicken and frequently 
die because they have no medical 
insurance, or to list testimonials about 
men and women who worked for 20 and 
30 years at jobs only to end up homeless 
and on food stamps. These kinds of facts 
are reported, if at all, very rarely in any 
media that the general public accesses. 
And even we who are supposed to be 
salvaging humanity are not that interested 
in facing them. Would we rather hear the 
good news only and take comfort in our 
jobs and our homes and our children’s 
education? 
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LoveWisdom is the great Ray of 
relationship, the carrier wave, the 
progenitor of harmony and beauty in 
Cosmos 

We all know that Good is alive and 
functioning. We all realize that 
consciousness is expanding, that some of 
our brothers and sisters are wakening up 
from the eons long drug trip. But these 
are the facts, Friends. This is the real 
macro picture of what is going down on 
this Planet. 

The planet is out of balance, big time, and 
Cosmos will not tolerate it. 
Reconstruction is happening now. It will 
continue in this rather destructive pattern 
until the Planet reaches some kind of 
harmony with the Plan, after which 
reconstruction will go forward; however, 
the reconstructions will be harmonic flows 
into new more perfect forms.  

We all know that 
nothing happens 
on this planet 
unless it comes 
through 
Humanity. We 
are the 4th

Halfway measures may not kill us all, but 
those who are left may not be that excited 
about their prospects. Many of us spend 
hours every day working on behalf of the 
common good and the general welfare. 
We need to and we can do more. 

 Kingdom. We are the doorway 
between the higher and lower three. The 
Great Invocation says “From the center 
which we call the race of men let the Plan 
of Love and Light workout.” It does not 
say that Humanity will be allowed to 
endlessly screw up the Plan. 

The need right now is for heartfelt and 
engendered solutions to these in-our-face 
gigantic problems. Such solutions will be 

practical, clear, commonsensical and 
understandable by those who either do 
not have the kinds of esoteric training we 
have or who are not accessing it. 

I am a great advocate of the fact of 
expanding consciousness. I have written 
thousands of words about it. A few years 
ago, I asked myself, “What does 
consciousness expanding mean, and 
what does it signify?” I had been working 
on the notion that it meant that more and 
more people were realizing that they were 
not separated from one another, that all 
humans were in fact interrelated and that 
we also had an indissolvable relationship 
and responsibility with and for everything 
else in and on the Planet. This is, I think, 

all accurate; 
however, it is 
only the 
manifestation of 

consciousness 
expansion. 

"When one’s consciousness expands", I 
asked, "into what does it expand?" The 
answer was that consciousness expands, 
or better, consciousness becomes able to 
encompass  the Cosmic energy stream of 
LoveWisdom. LoveWisdom is the great 
Ray of relationship, the basis of harmony 
and beauty in Cosmos. 

LoveWisdom supplies the motive for the 
beautiful and harmonious use of 
intelligence. Where LoveWisdom is 
lacking or underdeveloped, where the 
heart is closed and shriveled, there may 
be great intelligence, and it will generate 
systems of discord and incoherence. 
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Let us think more about our hearts 
and maybe we will begin to think in 
our hearts. That is where the 
solutions are. 
 

Until our love for humanity and the planet 
is stoked into flame, we will continue to 
see halfway efforts to deal with these 
problems. The 
problems will 
persist and grow 
until the 
destruction 
reaches even 
the sleepers in 
the cemetery of 
comfort. Then 
maybe we will awaken and do something 
about it. 

Actually, humanity knows, right now, 
everything that we need to know to 
enable us to manifest the solutions to 
these problems in new cooperative 
systems. Our job is to access the 
dimensions of solution and to bring the 
expanded understanding of ideas into the 
range of our brothers and sisters who are 
working to build the new civilizations. 

Let us think more about our hearts and 
maybe we will begin to think in our hearts. 
That is where the solutions are. 

Opportunity or 
crisis, if you like, is 
in our face. We 
who understand 
how energy works 
have a major 
practical and 
proactive role to 
play. I am haunted 

by the fact that we, many of us, were in 
this situation before. We could have 
performed better. Now we have a second 
chance or maybe a third chance. We can 
with our courage and our will prevail. 
“From the beginning they struggled. From 
the beginning We conquered.”                                      

Tom Carney 
May 2011 
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